Boone County Purchasing

Liz Palazzolo, CPPO, C.P.M. Senior Buyer



5551 S. Tom Bass Road Columbia, MO 65201 Phone: (573) 886-4392

Fax: (573) 886-4390

MEMORANDUM

TO:

Boone County Commission

FROM:

Liz Palazzolo, Senior Buyer

DATE:

July 24, 2025

RE:

Amendment #1 to Contract C000957 from Cooperative Contract

CC240449002- QVL Ammunition - Rifle and Pistol for the Boone

County Sheriff

Amendment #1 to contract C000957 awarded from cooperative contract CC240449002 – QVL Ammunition Rifle and Pistol for the Boone County Sheriff is being amended to add the purchase of ammunition as shown in the following table:

Line Item	Description	Firm Unit Price - Per Case	Number Cases	Total Extended Price
1.	Rifle Ammunition: .223 Duty Federal Tactical Bonded LE223T1 55gr	\$249.00/case - 200 rounds per case	135 (200-round cases) Total: 27,000 Rounds	\$33,615.00
2.	Rifle Ammunition: .223 Range Federal American Eagle AE223NX1 55gr FMJ full copper jacket w/ lead free primer	\$265.00/case - 500 rounds per case	40 (500-round cases) Total: 20,000 Rounds	\$10,600.00
3.	Rifle Ammunition: .223 Frangible Federal BallistiClean BC223NTS 42gr frangible	\$473.75/case - 500 rounds per case	10 (500-round cases) Total:	\$4,737.50

	bullet		5,000	
5.	Pistol Ammunition: 9mm Range Federal American Eagle AE9N1 9mm 124gr FMJ Lead Free	\$285.00/case – 1,000 rounds per case	Rounds 40 (1,000-round cases) Total: 40,000 Rounds	\$11,400.00
6.	Pistol Ammunition: 9mm Frangible Federal BallistiClean BC9NT3 100gr CQT Frangible	\$499.00/case – 5,000 rounds per case	5 (5,000-round cases) Total: 5,000 Rounds	\$2,495.00
8.	Buckshot Ammunition: 12 Gauge-Buckshot Federal BallistiClean BC132-00 12-gauge Buckshot 00 Frangible Non-lead	\$349.00/case – 250 rounds per case	1 (250-round cases) Total: 250 Rounds	\$349.00
9.	Rifle Slug Ammunition: 12 Gauge-Slug Federal BallistiClean BC127-RS 12-gauge rifle slug Frangible Non-lead	\$454.00/case – 250 rounds per case	1 (250-round cases) Total: 250 Rounds	\$454.00
10.	Rifle Slug Ammunition: 12 Gauge Less-Lethal Impact Munition CTS Part 125045 Model 2581 12-gauge Super-Sock Bean Bag	\$38.75/case – 5 rounds per case	80 (5-round cases) Total:400 Rounds	\$3,100.00
	Delivery Price	No Charge – FOB and Allowed Total Final Price	Destination Fr	\$66,750.50

The Purchasing Department requested quotes from the ammunition dealers on the Qualified Vendors List that sell the Hornady 9mm pistol ammunition. Seven vendors were solicited. Two bids and one "No Bids" were received.

- 1. Gulf States Distributors, Inc. of Montgomery, Alabama
- 2. Sunset Law Enforcement LLC of Ackley, Iowa
- 3. Bald Ridge Outdoors LLC of Van Buren, Missouri (No Response)
- 4. Howards Premium Ammo LLC of Florence, South Carolina (No Response)
- 5. On Target Ammunition LLC of Grain Valley, Missouri (No Bid)
- 6. Precision Delta Corporation of Ruleville, Mississippi (No Response)
- 7. Specialty Cartridge Inc. of Covington, Georgia (No Response)

The two bids received were reviewed by the Purchasing Department and the Sheriff's Office (see the attached Bid Tabulation/Cost Evaluation). The bid from Gulf States Distributors, Inc. of Montgomery, Alabama is the "lowest and best" bidder for the line items identified in the table. Major Gary German of the Sheriff's Office has recommended that the County proceed with the award to Gulf States Distributors, Inc. for this ammunition.

The contract was originally awarded December 31, 2024 via Commission Order 635-2024.

Payment for the ammunition will reference these codes:

- 1251 General Fund Sheriff Operations/23200 Ammunition: \$62,225.50;
- 1251 General Fund Sheriff Operations /23201 Ammunition (Less Lethal): \$3,100.00;
- 1255 General Fund Detention Operations/23200 Ammunition: \$1,425.00.

/lp

Attachment: Bid Tab/Cost Evaluation

c: Contract File

TION AMMUNITION QUOTE FOR SHERIFF - DUE 5PM 7-8-2025

NOIL	IION AMMUNITION QUOTE FOR SHERIFF - DUE 5PM 7-8-2025	-F - DUE 5PM /-8-2025	
	Description	Gulf States Distributors	Sunset Law Enforcement
	.223 Duty	\$1.245/round	No Bid
	Federal Tactical Bonded		
į	LE223T1 55gr		
	Estimate 30,000 rounds		
	.223 Range	\$.53/round	No Bid
	Federal American Eagle		1
	AE223NX1 55gr FMJ full		
	copper jacket w/ lead free		
	primer		
	Estimate 20,000 rounds		
	.223 Frangible	\$.9475/round	No Bid
	Federal BallistiClean		
	BC223NTS 42gr frangible		
	bullet		
	Estimate 5,000 rounds		
	9mm Duty	No Bid	\$.5866/round
	Hornady Critical Duty		
	90225 9mm +P Flex-Lock		
	135gr		
	Estimate 5,000 rounds		
	9mm Range	\$.285/round	No Bid
	Federal American Eagle		
	AE9N1 9mm 124gr FMJ Lead		
	Free		
	Estimate 40,000 rounds		
	9mm Frangible	\$.499/round	No Bid
	Federal BallistiClean		0
	BC9NT3 100gr CQT Frangible		
	Estimate 5,000 rounds		

ATION AMMUNITION QUOTE FOR SHERIFF - DUE 5PM 7-8-2025

3	Description	Gulf States Distributors	Sunset Law Enforcement
	.308 Duty	No Bid	\$1.3965/round
	Hornady TAP		
	80725 .308 Winchester		
	168gr ELD Match Tap		
V	Precision		
	Estimate 2,000 rounds		
	12 Gauge-Buckshot	\$1.396/round	No Bid
	Federal BallistiClean		
	BC132-00 12 gauge Buckshot		
	00 Frangible Non-lead		
	Estimate 500 rounds		
	12 Gauge-Slug	\$1.816/round	No Bid
Į,	Federal BallistiClean		
	BC127-RS 12 gauge rifle slug		
	Frangible Non-lead		
	Estimate 500 rounds		
	12 Gauge Less-Lethal Impact	\$7.75/round	No Bid
	Munition		
	CTS		
	Part 125045 Model 2581 12		
	gauge Super-Sock Bean Bag		
	Estimate 400 rounds		